
LCJVS Daily Announcements 

Friday, March 31, 2023 
   
LCJVS Announcements: 
Here are few daily announcements to share:  
 
The Lorain County JVS Combined Scholarship Application is now available on the JVS website and with Ms. West in Student 
Services. Completed applications are due to Ms. West in Student Services by April 3, 2023. No late applications will 
be accepted. 
 
College Now Greater Cleveland will be here at the JVS in Student Services on the below dates.  If you are 
interested, please stop by Student Services and see Ms. West to make an appointment. 
 
April 12, 2023 and April 26, 2023 
 
 
 
 
ASSOCIATE SCHOOL NEWS:    
 
Please click on the Associate School links on our website (under High School) for updated or detailed information.  
Some schools forward daily announcements while others can be found directly on their website. 
 
AMHERST 
 

• Prom:  Prom will be May 6th from 6pm – 10pm at Market Square in Crocker Park.  The theme is Northern Lights.  
Tickets will be on sale and online only starting at 7:45am on April 10th and will remain on sale through 3pm on April 
21st.  See Mrs. Doehr in the main office to receive your unique passcode to purchase your ticket.  Your passcode 
will NOT be your student ID. Your ticket must be purchased within 24 hours of receiving your passcode, unless you 
receive your passcode on April 21st in which case you will need to purchase your ticket by 3pm.  Outside guests’ 
forms are due by April 10th.  All school fees must be paid in full to attend. 

 
AVON 
 

• Prom Guest Forms:  Attention Seniors!  If you plan on bringing a guest from another school, you must turn in your 
Prom Guest form.  Pick up these forms in Student Services or the Main Office.  They must be turned in BEFORE 
you can purchase tickets.  Tickets go on sale Monday, April 17th. 

• Blood Drive:  The Red Cross is hosting the last blood drive of the year on Wednesday, April 5th.  See the signup 
tables in the lunch room or stop by room 176 to sign up for a spot.  Remember, each blood donation saves 3 lives. 

• Talent Show – Thursday, April 6th:  Student Council is looking for 10 talented acts to perform at the 2023 AHS 
Talent Show.  This year’s talent show will take place as a mid-day assembly on April 6th.  Five judges will determine 
the best act and who will take home a prize.  To audition, you must submit the google form with a video of your act 
by Tuesday, March 28th.  If you cannot submit a form, come see Ms. V in room 175 during your lunch period.  
Gather your band, practice your juggling, and rehearse your jokes…the stage is waiting for you! 

• Literary Club:  The Literary Club is hosting a community-wide writing contest.  Students, teachers, and members of 
the Avon community are invited to participate.  Write a one-half to three page fictional story based on one of the 
following prompts: “The Year 3000,” “I know you because I am me,” and, “How did we get here?” Or make your 
own! The competition will be running until the end of the day on April 4th.  Three winners will receive $50.  Send 
entries to ahsliteraryclub@gmail.com.  Information posters can be found around the school or see Ms. Hutner with 
questions. 

• Sparkle Cheer:  Sparkle Cheer is recruiting for the 23-24 school year!  Sparkle Cheer is an inclusive spirit team at 
Avon High School.  Our team seeks to spread school spirit to teams, clubs, classes, and the community during our 
year-long program.  Through an immersive and intensive cheer experience, cheerleaders will make new 
connections, spread Eagle Pride, and build cheer skills.  Our team is open to all high school students regardless of 
ability, gender, and prior cheer experience.  You must sign up for an interview to be considered for the Fall and/or 
Winter.  Interviews will be held after school on April 18th and 19th.  Interested students need to sign up for only one 
interview slot.  Reach out to vucoviche@avoneagles.org with any questions.   
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CLEARVIEW:    
• Attention Seniors:  Please submit your senior class slideshow pictures to gradslideshowchs23@gmail.com.  Email 

no more than 3 pictures.  Baby/young picture, Senior picture, and Group/Friend picture.  The deadline to submit 
your pictures is Friday, April 21st. 

• Prom Tickets:  Prom is Saturday, May 6th.  Tickets are on sale!  The cost is $70 each and can be purchased from 
Mrs. Alston in room 113 during homeroom or after school.  The last day to purchase a ticket is Friday, April 21st.   

• Prom Guest Forms:  If you’re bringing a guest to prom who does NOT attend Clearview High School, you must 
have a guest form.  Guest forms are due back no later than Wednesday, May 3rd. 

• Pep Rally:  It’s Senior versus the underclassmen!  Be on the lookout for an email for signups to play games at the 
pep rally on Wednesday, April 5th.  Will the underclassmen show the Seniors’ who’s the boss or will the Seniors 
reign supreme? See Mr. Ward with any questions.   

• Senior Scholarships:  Attention Seniors!  Wednesday, April 5th is the deadline for scholarship applications to be 
turned into the guidance office.   

• Senior Shirts:  The deadline to turn in senior shirt order forms will be Wednesday, April 5th.  Please turn your form 
and money (Cash only) into the counseling office. 

• Yearbook Cover Design Contest:  The yearbook team is holding a yearbook cover design contest.  Please check 
your email or the Yearbook Google Classroom for details if interested. 

• JVS:  If you are attending JVS for next school year, you need to respond to your acceptance letter by inputting the 
code provided.  We would like all responses by Monday, April 17th. 

 
COLUMBIA:  

• Bye Bye Birdie:  Purchase your tickets for Saturday performances, Friday, March 31st is sold out!  April 1st tickets 
are still available for the spring musical Bye Bye Birdie.  This show takes us back to the Rock & Roll 50’s, and it is 
comedic fun for the whole family.  For more information regarding casting as well as the link to tickets, please visit 
our website. 

• Senior Letters:  A Senior letter was mailed to all home residences of the class of 2023 on Tuesday, March 28th.  
Please read the information carefully and if you have any questions at this time call the office at 440-236-5001.   

• Attention Juniors and Seniors:  Prom 2023 is right around the corner.  Are you thinking of bringing a guest who 
does not attend Columbia High School?  Make sure you fill out a guest form and return to the main office prior to 
buying your prom tickets.  Tickets will go on sale Monday, April 3.  Go to our website for our Prom and After Prom 
information sheet. This was mailed to all juniors and seniors at the Columbia email and to all parents of juniors and 
seniors at the Columbia email and to all parents of juniors and seniors to the emails listed in PowerSchool on 
Tuesday, March 14. 

• CCP Students:  Any student who would like to apply for CCP for the 23-24 school MUST complete a Letter of 
Intent to Participate, LCCC application and LCCC Permission Slip by April 1, 2023.  Returning CCP students MUST 
complete the Letter of Intent to Participate. 

• Color Guard:  Are you interested in trying out for the Color Guard Squad for fall 2023?  Check out the flier with 
more details and contact information if you have questions. If you are interested, you must sign up in the main 
office.  Tryouts are on April 21st, 24th and 25th from 4:30pm-6:30pm in the high school gym. 
 

ELYRIA 
• Attention Seniors:  The Prom Song Request is available on the Class of 2023 Google Classroom. It will close on 

April 6th.  There will be no song requests at Prom, so please complete the form if you have requests. 
• Attention Juniors and Seniors:  Looking for a way to make money?  Look no more, because Elyria High is 

bringing local job opportunities to YOU!  On Tuesday, April 4th, Elyria High School is sponsoring its SECOND 
annual Hiring Expo!  Fifteen or more Elyria Businesses will be sending their very best representatives to conduct 
meet and greets and on the spot interviews with the very best of YOU!  If you are age 15 and older, come down to 
the PAC center between 2:30 and 3:00 on April 4th.  And don’t forget to Dress for Success!   

• Employment:  Do you like Golf and want to make money?  If you are interested in being a golf caddie, Elyria 
Country Club offers flexible hours, scholarship opportunities, golfing privileges, and more!  See Mr. Rainey in Room 
134 for more information.  

• Attention Seniors:  Prom tickets go on sale this Friday, March 31st online on the Elyria Athletics website.  Tickets 
are $40.  If you are bringing a guest from outside of Elyria High School, you must have a completed guest form on 
file with Mrs. Anderle with any questions.  

• Attention Seniors:  The Adult Career Center from the JVS will be visiting on Tuesday, April 4 at 12pm in room 239 
• Cedar Point is Hiring: Cedar Point is hosting a hiring event on April 1st and 2nd.  Come and get a flier or see it on 

our website for details.   
• Attention Seniors:  The Adult Career Center from the JVS will be visiting on Tuesday, April 4th at noon in room 

239.  They offer programs in cosmetology, automotive service, welding and more.  Please sign up on the Class of 
2023 Google Classroom or see Mrs. Anderle with questions. 
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• Student Council:  Student Council is hosting another pink cookie fundraiser. From today until April 3rd, you can find 
a member of the student council or go to Miss Frangella in room 201 or Miss Pokorny in room 206 to order pink 
cookies!  Cookies will be delivered in homeroom on April 5th.  You must pay for your cookies for your order to be 
placed!  The class that buys the most will get spirit points for their grade. 

• Special Olympics:  Anyone interested in volunteering for the Special Olympics this year, applications are in any of 
the Offices and in Room 112.  Please return to Room 112 before you leave for spring break. 

• Attention All Female Senior Athletes:  The Jim Vincent Memorial Scholarship is a $450 one-time award open to 
any female student athlete who has a minimum 2.0 GPA, is planning on attending a 2 year or 4 year college, can 
show financial need and displays the character traits of the late Jim Vincent. Applications for quality female athletes 
are available in the Elyria High Athletic Office located down the hall from the gym.  Deadline for submission of 
applications is Friday, April 21st. 

• College Credit Plus:  Want to earn college credit while in high school?  If yes, please see your Team Counselor or 
Mr. Burke in the Team 2 Office no later than March 31st.  This is our course scheduling period, please hurry! 

• Attention All Students interested in the medical field:  The Cleveland Clinic is hosting a paid summer internship.  
The deadline to apply is April 16.  Eligible students must be 15 years old by June 1st and have at least a 2.75 GPA.  
See Mrs. Anderle with questions.   
 
                         

FIRELANDS: 
• Prom:  Prom Ticket sales will begin on Monday April 3rd during your lunch periods.  They can also be available 

before and after school in Mr. Moyer’s room.  Please see a junior class representative in the office and at the time of 
purchase.  Cost, Location, and Time and any additional information can be found in google classroom. 

• Boys Soccer:  Boys soccer open gyms will be canceled next Tuesday (4-4-23). 
• Attention All Students:  It is important to check your student email every day for vital information regarding 

changes to your schedule or other notices from staff.  
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