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PHS Junior/Senior
Prom

Some of our Little Hound
Alum stopped by during
their First Responder duties
today to visit with our
students at and oversee
our emergency drills.

PES First Responder
Visit!

We are excited to share
information about our
spring club offerings.
Please take a moment to
complete a form for each
student indicating your
interest in clubs that your
child would like to
participate in. We have
offerings including: Drama,
STLP, Chess, Odyssey of
the Mind. We are also
considering: Running Club,
Archery, and Golf. You also
have the option to share
other clubs we should
consider. We will accept
responses through next
Wednesday. Click HERE

PES Spring Club
Interest Form

The girls Montgomery Co
game for tonight has been
rescheduled for Monday
night at 6:30pm at
Montgomery Co. It will be
a Varsity game only.

Rescheduled Varsity
Girls Basketball Game
vs. Montgomery Co.

Save the Date!
Paris High School
Junior/Senior prom will be
Saturday, May 7th, 2022

https://forms.gle/PUD84Ep6yoKKpiaGA
https://forms.gle/PUD84Ep6yoKKpiaGA

